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STATEMENT OF APPLICANT OBLIGATION FOR PAYMENT 
OF CERTAIN PROFESSIONAL COSTS AND EXPENSES 

 
The Applicant is obligated by Chapter 37: General Fee Schedule to pay the City of West 
Carrollton (“City”) for all costs and expenses incurred by the City if this application or request 
causes the City to incur expenses and costs for an independent consultant to either review, 
evaluate or comment on data or information submitted by the Applicant, or to prepare 
information or data in connection with the City’s review and evaluation of the application or 
request.  If an application or request filed with the City causes the City to devote to that same 
application or request time and professional skills of a City employee who is an engineer or 
surveyor (or other member of a so-called “learned professional”, the members of which are 
licensed by or registered with the State of Ohio), the costs and expenses to the City of the time 
devoted to that application or request shall be the obligation of the Applicant.  The total amount 
of such costs and expenses shall be derived by the method of calculation pursuant to the then 
current legislative policy for such calculation. 
 
The payment of expenses and costs referred to in this statement shall be made to the City of 
West Carrollton in accordance with the then current administrative policy for such payment.  An 
application or request may require funds to be deposited in advance with the City for such costs 
and expenses.  The payment of such costs and expenses shall be in addition to any other 
application fee required by the City, and must be received by the City before any permits for the 
property will be approved and issued. 
 
The person whose signature appears below as Applicant states that she/he has full and 
complete authority to agree to, bind and obligate the Applicant to pay the costs and expenses 
referred to in this statement and to fully comply with the above statement. 
 
By the signature below, the Applicant herein states she/he has fully and completely read the 
above statement, understands the above statement, and agrees to fully comply with the above 
statement. 
By: ______________________________________ 
            Applicant’s Signature 
 
 
Date:  ____________________________________ 
        
Project:  __________________________________ 
 
 
Sworn to before me and subscribed in my presence by the said 

__________________________ on this ________ day of ____________________, 2____. 

 
 
 
      _________________________________________ 
      Notary Public  


